

COMMONWEALTH OF MASSACHUSETTS

WORCESTER, ss.

SUPERIOR COURT
DEPARTMENT OF THE TRIAL COURT
CA No. 2085-CV-00971D

JOEL BURMAN as the Legal Representative of
the Estate of Mary Burman, on behalf of Ms.
Burman and all others similarly situated,

Plaintiff,

v.

CONTINUING CARE MANAGEMENT LLC;
WHITNEY PLACE AT SHARON LLC;
WHITNEY PLACE AT SHARON LIMITED
PARTNERSHIP, d/b/a WHITNEY PLACE AT
SHARON; WHITNEY PLACE AT SHARON
MANAGEMENT LLC; SALMON HEALTH
AND RETIREMENT; and SHI II WHITNEY
PLACE SHARON, LLC.,

Defendants.

PLAINTIFF'S UNOPPOSED FEE AND EXPENSE APPLICATION

Michael C. Forrest, Esq.
BBO # 681401
Forrest, Mazow, McCullough,
Yasi & Yasi, P.C.
2 Salem green, Suite 2
Salem, MA 01970
(617) 231-7829

I. INTRODUCTION

Now comes Joel Burman, personal representative of the estate of Mary Burman (“Plaintiff” or “Burman”) by and through counsel (“Class Counsel”), and hereby submits this Fee and Expense Application (“Application”) for approval by this Court. This Application is submitted by Plaintiff’s Counsel, Forrest, Mazow, McCullough, Yasi, and Yasi, P.C. (“Plaintiff’s Counsel” or “Class Counsel”). Plaintiff’s Counsel has served as counsel for Plaintiff and the Settlement Class in the above-captioned action (“Action”) since its inception in 2020. Without the time, work, and resources (provided on an entirely contingent basis), this settlement would not have occurred. As such, Plaintiff’s Counsel respectfully submits that this fee request is fair and reasonable whether evaluated on a lodestar basis or using a percentage of fund methodology.

Through this Application, Plaintiff now seeks an award of fees and expenses, as well as an incentive award, to be approved and paid to the Plaintiff per the terms of the Settlement Agreement preliminarily approved by this Court. Accordingly, Plaintiff now seeks an award of attorneys’ fees and costs in the amount of \$250,000.00 (25% of Claim Fund). Further, this application seeks \$96,670.73 in costs and expenses advanced by Class Counsel, including costs of class administration. Finally, this application respectfully requests that the Court allow Plaintiff’s application for incentive award for his continued service and participation throughout this lengthy litigation in the amount of \$25,000.00.

Defendant does not oppose this Application for Attorneys’ Fees, Expenses, and Incentive Award per the terms of the Settlement Agreement, and in recognition of the resolution of claims containing cost-shifting provisions. See, Settlement Agreement, Art. VI.

The Attorneys’ Fees sought by this Application are supported by Plaintiff’s Counsels’ lodestar (and expenses) related to all work performed in pursuit and resolution of this Action. The

award sought is also supported in the attached affidavits and of: (1) Michael C. Forrest, Esq.; (3) John R. Yasi, Esq.; and (4) Robert E. Mazow, Esq. See, Exhibits 1-3 (*Affidavits of Sr. Counsel - FMMYY*); Exhibit 4 (*Master Bill of FMMYY*); and Exhibit 5 (*FMMYY Master Billing Sheets - Redacted*).¹

Finally, before providing a full detailed summary supporting the basis for the request for an award of attorneys' fees and costs, Plaintiff sets forth the following factors for consideration by the Court to further place this application in context:

1. Plaintiff's Counsel litigated this Action on a contingency fee basis;
2. This Case presents novel issues related to the permissibility of certain upfront charges imposed upon elderly residents of Massachusetts Assisted Living Residences ("ALRs");
3. The Settlement Agreement resolves a complex class action, with hundreds of Settlement Class Members;
4. Plaintiff alleged multiple claims under M.G.L. c. 93A, § 2 and M.G.L. c. 186 § 15B, both of which contain fee-shifting provisions;
5. Plaintiff's Counsel has significant experience handling class actions, and other consumer protection matters, including matters similar to this action, which led to the efficient and successful resolution of the Action;
6. Litigation of this Action has been ongoing for several years as this action was filed in September of 2020;
7. The Settlement Agreement represents an excellent result as it provides monetary relief to Class Members;

¹ The Master Billing Sheets have been provided in redacted format as to avoid disclosure of confidential information. In the event the Court desires an unredacted Master Billing Sheets for *in camera* review, Plaintiff shall submit the same forthwith at the request of the Court.

8. Class Members who are residents at Defendants' property are not required to complete a Claim Form as those Class Members will be paid directly;
9. Pursuant to the terms of Settlement Agreement, Defendant has agreed not to oppose a fee and expense application seeking \$250,000.00 as consideration of attorneys' fees incurred in pursuit of Plaintiff and the Settlement Class's claims;
10. Pursuant to the terms of Settlement Agreement, Defendant has agreed not to oppose an application seeking consideration of incentive award in consideration for Plaintiff's respective participation in this action; as well as his dedication to the Class and prosecution of this action to a successful class-wide conclusion;
11. Plaintiff's Counsel expended time judiciously, and incurred reasonable costs; and
12. To date, despite seeking only \$250,000.00, Plaintiff's Counsel's lodestar fees and expenses amount to a total of \$391,687.50 as of April 14, 2023 (exclusive of costs).

For these reasons, and the reasons herein, Plaintiff respectfully requests this Court approve *Plaintiff's Fee and Expense Application*.

II. PROCEDURAL BACKGROUND

On or about September 9, 2020, Mary Burman commenced this action in the Worcester County Superior Court. See, *Docket Ref. No. 1*. On November 12, 2020, Mary Burman passed away. On January 20, 2021, Joel Burman was appointed the legal representative of the estate of Mary Burman. On February 17, 2021, this Court allowed the requested substitution of Joel Burman as the legal representative of the estate of Mary Burman. On September 22, 2021, the Parties mediated this action with the Hon. Hinkle, J. (Ret.); however, the parties were not able to come to an agreement at that time. On October 8, 2021, Plaintiff filed a *Motion to Amend*. On October 14, 2021 the Court allowed the proposed amendment to the operative complaint.

On January 28, 2022, Plaintiff filed her second *Motion to Amend*, to include claims for Breach of Contract based upon allegations that despite the plain and unambiguous language in its Residency Agreements, Defendants purportedly did not utilize any portion of the Community Fees for the express purposes it promised and represented to its ALR tenants in the Residency Agreements. On February 8, 2022 the Court allowed the proposed amendment to the operative complaint.

On April 14, 2022, Plaintiff filed her *Motion for Class Certification*. On June 2, 2022 the Court heard argument on Plaintiff's *Motion for Class Certification*. On August 9, 2022 the Court denied Plaintiff's *Motion for Class Certification* holding that, *inter alia*, the resolution of over 100 claims was not impracticable; and further, that an individual assessment of harm would be required. See, Docket No. 22; but see, In re TJX Cos. Retail Sec. Breach Litig., 246 F.R.D. 389, 398 (D. Mass. 2007) ("Need for individualized damages decisions does not ordinarily defeat predominance requirement for class certification where there are disputed common issues as to liability."); and Campbell v. Glodis, 2011 WL 2736502, *5 (Mass. Super. Ct. May 27, 2011) ("the presence of individual questions does not, *per se*, contraindicate class action treatment.").

On February 23, 2023, the Court allowed preliminary Approval and certified a settlement class for the purposes of class-wide settlement.

III. ARGUMENT

After three years of active litigation, Plaintiff's Counsel has achieved an excellent recovery on behalf of the Settlement Class. The Settlement Agreement, if approved, provides available compensation/reimbursement to former and current Assisted Living Residents through the Claim Fund in the amount of \$1,000,000.00.

Accordingly, as compensation for the successful prosecution of these Claims, Plaintiff now

respectfully seeks an award of attorneys' fees and expenses in connection with the resolution of the Action.

Here the Parties have endeavored to avoid further litigation so as to resolve all pending matters by way of a single agreement. See e.g., Hensley v. Eckerhart, 461 U.S. 424, 437 (1983) (“A request for attorney's fees should not result in a second major litigation. Ideally, of course, litigants will settle the amount of a fee.”); Barrow v. Barrow, 2017 WL 2953636, at *3 (D. Mass. July 10, 2017)(same); and Gorgens v. McGovern, 2008 WL 2754527, at *5 (Mass. App. Ct. July 15, 2008) (“It is unfortunate that the parties have failed to heed Justice Powell’s admonition that ‘[a] request for attorney’s fees should not result in a second major litigation. Ideally, of course, litigants will settle the amount of a fee.’”).

Thus, for the reasons set forth in more detail herein, the request for Counsels’ fees is fair and reasonable, particularly considering the excellent recovery for the Class, the application of the percentage of fund methodology with a “Lodestar” method cross-check,² and the response of the Court and Class Members.

A. Plaintiff’s Counsel has Achieved an Excellent Outcome for Class Members.

Plaintiff’s Counsel negotiated and achieved an excellent recovery on behalf of Plaintiff and the Members of the Settlement Class. The favorable terms of the Settlement Agreement lend support to *Plaintiff’s Application* for an award for fees and expenses, as well as an incentive award to the named Class Representative.

That is, if this Court enters Final Approval of the proposed settlement, the principal terms

² While Plaintiff’s Application seeks only 25% of the claim fund, he provides a lodestar analysis as a cross-check of the reasonableness of the fees sought. See, In re Neurontin Mktg. & Sales Practices Litig., 58 F. Supp. 3d 167, 172 (D. Mass. 2014) (“[a]n empirical study of federal class action fee awards in 2006 and 2007 found that nearly two-thirds of class action fee awards based on the percentage method were between 25% and 35% of the common fund.”);

include the following:

B. Class Member Compensation:

The benefits to the Class are readily apparent and valued. That is, with respect to the available monetary award available to each resident (or former resident) settlement Class Member, the settlement provides the following:

1. Class Claim Fund

Salmon Health shall make a total settlement, in accordance with the claims procedures set forth herein, of one million dollars (\$1,000,000.00) (“Claim Fund”). The Claim Fund shall cover all payments to be made to participating Settlement Class Members, as well as the costs of Notice, Administration, Plaintiff’s Incentive Award and Plaintiff’s Counsel’s costs and fees. The Claim Fund class payments shall be distributed to:

- A. Any former resident Settlement Class Member who paid a Community Fee or Last Month’s Charges during the Class Period. Said Settlement Class Member shall be entitled to their *pro rata* share of the Claim Fund, which amount shall be distributed by the Claims Administrator in the manner set forth herein.
- B. Any Settlement Class Member who, as of the time of Final Approval, is a current resident Settlement Class Member of a Salmon Health ALR and who paid a Community Fee or Last Month’s Charges during the Class Period. Said Class Member shall be entitled to their *pro rata* share of the Claim Fund, which amount shall be distributed by the Claims Administrator in the manner set forth herein. Current resident Settlement Class Members shall not be required to submit a Claim Form to be entitled to their *pro rata* share of the Claim Fund.
- C. The cost of Class Notice, administration, incentive award, and attorney fees shall be funded by the Claim Fund.

2. Unclaimed Funds:

The checks issued by the Claims Administrator shall be valid for ninety (90) days following their issuance or receipt after return as undeliverable. The Parties agree that should any Settlement Class Member fail to cash their check within ninety (90) days of its issuance, and after reasonable efforts to locate such persons for whom such checks were returned, such unclaimed funds shall be re-distributed to class members who submitted claims or qualify as current residents. Should any Settlement Class Member fail to cash the second distribution

check within ninety (90) days of its issuance then any such unclaimed funds shall be paid to the Massachusetts IOLTA Committee as the *cy pres* beneficiary.

3. Remedial Measures/ Equitable Relief

- A. Last Month's Charges Fee. Going forward, for all prospective residents at ALRs owned, operated, and/or managed by Salmon Health in Massachusetts, Salmon Health shall deposit any Last Month's Charges collected from such residents in an interest-bearing account; and further, shall credit, or pay, accrued interest on the Last Month's Charges to residents on an annual basis or, should a residency agreement terminate prior to its one year anniversary, shall pay interest within thirty (30) days of the date of the termination of said residency agreement.
1. For all current residents who paid Last Month's Charges, upon termination of their tenancy Salmon shall credit the resident's account in the amount deposited plus 5% per annum and apply it to outstanding charges and return any balance.
- B. Community Fees. Going forward, Salmon Health shall deposit Community Fees collected from such residents in a separate account and allocate such funds solely for ALR-distinctive services.
- C. Subsequent Legal Confirmation. The remedial measures described above shall continue to the earlier of: (i) judicial, legislative, or regulatory guidance confirming that such an approach is not necessary to comply with M.G.L. §15B and or M.G.L 19D, § 1; or (ii) a five-year period which commences upon the anticipated date of the final approval of the Settlement.

See, Settlement Agreement, Art. III.

C. Costs of Settlement Class Notice and Administration

Per the terms of Settlement, the cost of Class notice distribution and administration shall be funded by the Claim Fund. See, Settlement Agreement, Art. III(c).

D. Consumer Protection Jurisprudence Supports Plaintiff's Fee Application.

Fee shifting provisions serve two important functions. See, Ferman v. Sturgis Cleaners, Inc., 481 Mass. 488, 492-493 (2019)(statutory fee-shifting "act[s] as a powerful disincentive against unlawful conduct.... Second, [statutory fee-shifting] often provide[s] an incentive for attorneys to provide representation in cases that otherwise would not be financially prudent for them to take on, and in that sense they help to assure that claimants who might not be able to afford

counsel, or whose claims are too small to warrant an expenditure of funds for counsel, will be represented.”). Id. (Internal citations omitted).

Settlement of a claim wherein the defendant provides a portion of the relief demanded in the action satisfies the “prevailing party” requirement of fee-shifting statutes in Massachusetts. Id. (“a plaintiff prevails for purposes of an award of attorney’s fees under [a fee shifting statute] when his or her suit satisfies the catalyst test by acting as a necessary and important factor in causing the defendant to provide a material portion of the relief demanded in the plaintiff’s complaint.”). Such is the case *sub judice*. Further, when looking at an application for fees and costs under a fee-shifting statute, public policy considerations inherent in statutes with fee-shifting provisions such as M.G.L. c. 93A, does not require that the Court consider the proportionality of a fee award compared with the benefit obtained. See, Arthur D. Little Int’l v. Dooyang Co., 995 F. Supp. 217, 225 (D. Mass. 1998) (awarding attorneys’ fees under M.G.L. c. 93A of \$915,707.00 where damages totaled \$460,000.00 because “[f]ees awarded pursuant to Massachusetts statutory authority must not necessarily be reduced because they are high in relation to the award of damages.”); and Olmstead v. Murphy, 21 Mass. App. Ct. 664, 666 (1986) (“When the public, as here, has a particular interest in the vindication of a legal right, the market value of legal services, based on a reasonable expenditure of time and a reasonable time charge, should not be automatically discounted because that value is high in relation to the amount recovered”).³

As the United States Supreme Court held with respect to the fee-shifting provisions in civil

³See also, Graham v. Vengroff, Williams & Assoc., Inc., Civ. No. 02-0369 MV/RLP (D. N. Mex. Oct 4, 2004)(class settlement of \$3,975, attorneys’ fees of \$19,341.16 awarded in contested fee application); Henderson v. Eaton, 2002 WL 31415728 (E.D. La. Oct. 25, 2002)(The court reaffirmed the position that “a rule of proportionality between the fee awarded and the damages recovered in determining the award of attorney fees” is expressly rejected and inapplicable, and accordingly, awarded \$19,341.16 in attorneys’ fees when class settlement was only \$3,975); and Campos v. Choicepoint Services, Inc., 2007 WL 2001797 (N.D. Ga. July 5, 2007)(class settlement of \$168,000 under Fair Credit Reporting Act, attorneys’ fees of \$425,000 awarded “based on the Court’s over 25 years’ experience in the profession including as a lawyer who litigated complex commercial cases, including class actions”).

rights actions, proportionality of damages should be irrelevant in evaluating the fee application of a prevailing plaintiff in the action, stating: “[a] rule that limits attorney’s fees in civil rights cases to a proportion of the damages awarded would seriously undermine Congress’ purpose in enacting §1988.” See, City of Riverside v. Rivera, 477 U.S. 561, 576 (1986). The City of Riverside Court specifically rejected the contention “that fee awards in damages cases should be modeled upon the contingent-fee arrangements commonly used in personal injury litigation”. Id., at 573. As the Supreme Court explained:

The contingent fee arrangements that make legal services available to many victims of personal injuries would often not encourage lawyers to accept civil rights cases, which frequently involve substantial expenditures of time and effort but produce only small monetary recoveries.

Id. at 577. Thus, “[p]aying counsel in [fee-shifting] cases at rates lower than they can obtain in the marketplace is inconsistent with the congressional desire to enforce [consumer protection statutes] through private actions and therefore misapplies the law.” Tolentino v. Friedman, 46 F.3d 645, 652-53 (7th Cir. 1995).

These same principles apply to actions brought pursuant to M.G.L. c. 93A, regardless of whether a case is litigated to judgment or settled. See e.g., Ferman v. Sturgis Cleaners, Inc., 481 Mass. 488, 496 (2019).

E. The “Lodestar” Method Supports the Reasonableness of the Percentage of Fund Award Sought.

In determining the reasonableness of fees, the ultimate determination is left to the sound discretion of the judge. Berman v. Linnane, 434 Mass. 301, 302-303 (2001).

There is no set method for making a determination of reasonable attorney’s fees, nor is one single factor determinative. Nevertheless, the Court can take guidance from an analysis of “the nature of the case and the issues presented, the time and labor required, the amount of damages involved, the result obtained, the experience, reputation and ability of the attorney, the usual price

charged for similar services by other attorneys in the same area, and the amount of awards in similar cases.” Id. at 303.

Further, “[t]he basic measure of reasonable attorney’s fees is a ‘fair market rate for the time reasonably spent preparing and litigating a case.’” Stowe v. Bologna, 417 Mass. 199, 203, (1994)(citations omitted). This approach to attorney’s fees calculations is known as the “lodestar” approach, and the results it produces “should govern unless there are special reasons to depart from them.” Killeen v. Westban Hotel Venture, LP., 69 Mass.App.Ct. 784, 790 (2007)(citations omitted). In determining attorneys’ fees and under the “lodestar” (“Lodestar”) approach, much is left to the discretion of the trial judge, for he/she typically “is in the best position to determine how much time was reasonably spent on a case, and the fair value of the attorney’s services.” Fontaine v. Ebtec Corp., 415 Mass. 309, 324 (1993). As the Court has opined, “[t]he determination of what constitutes ‘reasonable’ attorney’s fees in any given case is more art than science.” Id.

Accordingly, the Lodestar method directs a court to determine the fair market rate for the legal services provided and multiply that rate by the number of hours reasonably spent on the case. See e.g., Fontaine, supra, at 326; see also, In re Thirteen Appeals Arising out of the San Juan Dupont Plaza Hotel Fire Litig., 56 F.3d 295, 305 (1st Cir.1995).

Here the reasonableness of the expenses and fees sought is easily confirmed by the fact that the fees and expenses sought by way of this application represent the successful resolution of a claim litigated since 2020. The reasonableness of the amount sought by this application is further reflected by the fact that Class Counsel seeks significantly less than their lodestar in the present action.

Here, at the time of filing, over the approximately the last three years, Plaintiff’s Counsel has committed at least 693.90 billable hours to the pursuit of this claim. The resulting lodestar for

this work amounts to \$391,687.50.

Accordingly, Plaintiff respectfully submits that the Settlement here is an excellent result. Here, the fee requested (255 of the Claim Fund) is significantly less than Counsels' lodestar for this action.

F. The Percentage of Fund Methodology further Evidences the Reasonableness of the Fees and Expenses Sought.

Massachusetts Court's recognize the "lodestar approach" as a method for determining the reasonableness of a fee sought in connection with the settlement of a class action brought pursuant to a fee shifting statute. See e.g., Fontaine v. Ebtec Corp., 415 Mass. 309, 326 (1993); and Commonwealth Care All. v. Astrazeneca Pharms. L.P., 2013 WL 6268236, at *2 (Mass. Super. Aug. 5, 2013). However, while the lodestar approach is not required, it may be advantageous. See, WHTR Real Est. Ltd. P'ship v. Venture Distrib., Inc., 63 Mass. App. Ct. 229, 236 (2005) ("The landlord is incorrect. Fontaine does not require use of the lodestar approach; rather, it states that such an approach may be advantageous."); see also, Berman v. Linnane, 434 Mass. 301, 303 (2001) ("approv[ing]" of the use of the lodestar test, but not requiring it).

Here, the compensation sought in this litigation for their efforts amounts to percentage of fund award of 25% in successfully resolved class action as can be evidenced by a comparison of the percentage of fund doctrine with the request made by way of this application.

That is, in the case *sub judice*, Plaintiff contends that reasonableness of the fee sought (in addition to the lodestar cross-check) is evidenced by the fact that the class-wide recovery and the requested award of costs, attorneys' fees fairly reflect the successful prosecution and settlement of this Action, reflecting 25% of the class member Claim Fund secured. See, In re Neurontin Mktg. & Sales Practices Litig., 58 F. Supp. 3d 167, 172 (D. Mass. 2014)(In awarding 28% of the class fund as attorney's fees, the court explained that "[a]n empirical study of federal class action fee

awards in 2006 and 2007 found that nearly two-thirds of class action fee awards based on the percentage method were between 25% and 35% of the common fund.”); see also, Mazola v. May Dept. Stores Co., 1999 WL 1261312, at *4 (D. Mass. Jan. 27, 1999) (“[I]n this circuit, percentage fee awards range from 20% to 35% of the fund. This approach mirrors that taken by the federal courts in other jurisdictions.”); Pavlidis v. New England Patriots Football Club, 675 F. Supp. 707, 709-712 (D. Mass. 1987) (20%-50% range in common fund class actions are not uncommon); Boeing Co. v. Van Gemert, 444 U.S. 472, 479 (1980) (“Although the full value of the benefit to each absentee member cannot be determined until he presents his claim, a fee awarded against the entire judgment fund will shift the costs of litigation to each absentee in the exact proportion that the value of his claim bears to the total recovery.”); Waters v. Int'l Precious Metals Corp., 190 F.3d 1291, 1297 (11th Cir. 1999)(same); Camden I Condo. Association v. Dunkle, 946 F.2d 768, 774 (11th Cir. 1991) (same); and David v. America Suzuki Motor Corp., No. 08-cv-22278, (S.D. Fla. April 15, 2010) (same).⁴ In light of the excellent recovery obtained on behalf of all resident settlement Class Members; as well as utilizing a percentage of fund methodology, the fee presently requested is fair and reasonable.

⁴ See also, Mendez v. Job Done LLC, No. 1281CV04992, Dkt. # 28 (Mass. Super. Nov. 18, 2014) (awarding 33% of the fund as attorneys' fee award); Barkley v. The Convertible Castle, Inc., d/b/a Bernie and Phyl's Furniture, No. 1384CV01078-BLS1, Dkt. # 25 (Mass. Super. Sept. 15, 2014) (approving attorneys' fees and expenses of 30% of the class settlement fund); Yeretzian v. Subcontracting Concepts, Inc., No. 1084CV02655, Dkt. # 77 (Mass. Super. Oct. 31, 2018) (awarding 33 1/3% of the fund as an attorneys' fee and expense award); Banks v. SBH Corp., No. SUCV2004-03515, Dkt. # 24 (Mass. Super. Nov. 19, 2007) (approving attorneys' fees and expenses of 33 1/3% of the class settlement fund); Byrne v. Elephant & Castle Group, Inc., No. SUCV2006-04732, Dkt. # 12 (Mass. Super. Apr. 24, 2008) (awarding 33 1/3% of the fund as an attorneys' fee and expense award); and DeVito v. Longwood Security Services, Inc., No. 1384CV01724, Dkt. # 117 (Mass. Super. Nov. 7, 2018) (approving fees of one-third of settlement fund).

G. The Effort and Expense Expended by Plaintiff's Counsel was Reasonable in Light of the Nature of the Claim, the Issues Presented.

When determining the reasonableness of a fee award the Court should look to “the nature of the case and the issues presented, the time and labor required, the amount of damages involved, the result obtained, the experience, reputation and ability of the attorney, the usual price charged for similar services by other attorneys in the same area, and the amount of awards in similar cases.” Berman v. Linnane, 434 Mass. 301, 303 (2001). However, “[n]o one factor is determinative, and a factor-by-factor analysis, although helpful, is not required.” Id. (citations omitted).

Here, the combined 693.90 hours of time expended by Plaintiff's Counsel in this Action as a result of over three (3) years of litigation and through the finalization of this Application is fair and reasonable in light of the substantial work required and performed. Furthermore, as a direct result of the efforts expended Plaintiff's Counsel, the settlement's value is enhanced by benefits being provided to the Class now, without the delay, risks, and burdens of further litigation. Moreover, the settlement provides prospective equitable relief which alters Salmon Health's previous up-front collection policies.

In support of the reasonableness of the time spent in litigating this action, Plaintiff now provides a brief summary of the tasks and efforts undertaken by counsel during the course of litigation:

1. Initial Claim Investigation and Activities:

Plaintiff's Counsel consulted with Plaintiff and others in order to analyze all materials relevant to the asserted claims and made determinations as to the viability of various claim(s) under applicable state law and regulation. In doing so, Plaintiff's counsel formulated the theory of liability which has served as the basis for the present claim.

2. Discovery, Depositions, Related Discovery Disputes, and Interlocutory Appeal.

In early pursuit of this claim, Burman served Salmon Health with comprehensive written discovery requests. Thereafter, Salmon Health provided written responses and significant documentation in response to Plaintiff's discovery requests.

3. Amendments and Motion Practice

Throughout the litigation of the pending matters, Plaintiff successfully moved to amend the complaint. On February 17, 2021, this Court also allowed the requested substitution of Joel Burman as the legal representative of the estate of Mary Burman.

In addition, Counsel for Plaintiff drafted, filed and argued Plaintiff's *Motion for Class Certification*.

4. Mediation of Claims

On September 22, 2021, the Parties mediated this action with the Hon. Hinkle, J. (Ret.), however, resolution of this claim did not occur at that time.

5. Settlement Documentation, Oversight and Final Approval.

After reaching the initial terms of settlement, Plaintiff's counsel drafted a comprehensive settlement agreement, setting forth the comprehensive terms of settlement. This drafting required several iterations to be circulated between the parties to ensure the final agreement was sufficiently reviewed by Salmon Health and the Plaintiff.

In addition to the drafting of the settlement agreement, Plaintiff's counsel also drafted the proposed Notice(s), claim forms, and proposed preliminary approval order.⁵

During this time, Plaintiff's counsel also fielded numerous inquiries from settlement class members and remained in constant contact with the Claims Administrator to ensure compliance

⁵ Plaintiff's Counsel also drafted the Joint Motion for the Establishment of a Qualified Settlement Fund.

with the terms of notice and settlement.

Plaintiff's Counsel also drafted *Plaintiff's Unopposed Motion for Final Approval* and *Plaintiff's Fee and Expense Application* in anticipation of Final Approval.

Finally, Plaintiff's counsel prepared and attended the Preliminary Approval Hearing, and shall need to prepare and attend the final approval hearing.

H. Class Counsel Assumed A Significant Risk of Non-Recovery and the Novelty Of The Issues Raised Heightened The Risk.

While Plaintiff believes that his claim has merit, and further, that he would be make a compelling case at trial, he nevertheless, faced critical legal and factual issues which created the very real prospect of loss. As such, because Class Counsel's work on this case was entirely contingent, Plaintiff's counsel bore the entire risk of loss.

As Judge Posner explains, there is a significant risk factor associated with these claims:

A contingent fee must be higher than the fee for the same legal services as they are performed. The contingent fee compensates the lawyer not only for the legal services he renders, but also for the loan of those services. The implicit interest rate on such a loan is higher because the risk of default (the loss of the case, which cancels the debt of the client to the lawyer) is much higher than that of a conventional loan.

Richard Posner, *Economic Analysis of Law*, 534, 567 (4th ed. 1992).

Here, the novelty of the claim as well as certification issues had the potential to derail the successful litigation of these claims altogether.

However, as a result of this settlement, Plaintiff's counsel has secured all affected current and former residents rights to obtain relief by way of the approval of the proposed class action settlement. Such a result further demonstrates the reasonableness of the requested fee award.

I. Plaintiff's Counsels' Extensive Experience Handling Class Action Matters Led to the Success and Efficiency of the Settlement of this Action.

The Lodestar method (used here as a cross-check) includes consideration of: (1) the

prevailing billing rate in the local legal marketplace; and (2) the experience and skills of the lawyers performing work on the case. See e.g., Blum v. Stenson, 465 U.S. 886, 895 (1984).

a) Plaintiff's Counsels' Rates are Reasonable and Consistent With Those Charged by Massachusetts Lawyers of Similar Skill and Experience.

As set forth in herein, Plaintiff's Counsels' fees are consistent with rates of similar attorneys in the Massachusetts legal market. Plaintiff seeks fees for the attorneys as follows: (1) Partner, John R. Yasi, Esq., \$625.00/hr.; (2) Partner, Michael C. Forrest, Esq., \$525.00/hr.; and (3) Partner, Robert E. Mazow, Esq. \$625/hr.

In support of the reasonableness of Plaintiff's Counsels' rates, Plaintiff notes that as far back as 2013, the average billable market rate for a partner in Boston was \$598.00/hour and the average associate hourly rate was \$388.21/hr. See, Brandon Gee, *The Going Rate(s): 2013 "Real Rate Report" Reveals Who's Charging What in the Legal Community*, Lawyers Weekly, October 14, 2013 at page 1.

Moreover, studies show that in the last several years alone, billable hours at national law firms have increased by more than 10%. See, Katelyn Polantz, The National Law Journal, *Billing Rates Rise, Discounts Abound: A 10 percent increase is offset by price cuts*, January 5, 2015, <http://www.nationallawjournal.com/id=1202713809557/Billing-Rates-Rise-Discounts-Abound> (last visited April 26, 2023). As such, the billing rates charged by Plaintiff's Counsel are reasonable when compared to the prevailing billing rates in the local legal marketplace, especially when considering inflation due to average yearly rate increases.

In addition to Plaintiff's Counsels' comparable reasonable market rates, the attorneys of listed herein have been approved in other matters at the rates presented in the Application.⁶

⁶ See e.g., See e.g., O'Hara et al. v. Diageo Beer Co., et al, CA No. 1:15-cv-14139-MLW (Allowed December 2, 2021, Wolf, J.); Moran et al. v. Stonehill College, CA No. 2077-cv-00431A (Allowed August 18, 2022, Dunigan, J.); Hartigan et al. v. The Realty Assoc. fund X LP., et al., CA No. SUCV-2018-00056-BLS1 (Allowed October 5, 2021,

b) Plaintiff's Counsel Has Achieved Favorable Results in Numerous Class Actions.

Over the last ten (10) years, the attorneys of Forrest, Mazow, McCullough, Yasi & Yasi, PC, have gained extensive experience through the litigation of multiple class actions. Moreover, the Firm's attorneys have successfully served as Class Counsel, and obtained favorable results and awards, on behalf of multiple consumer classes.

In light of the experience of the firms listed above, as well as the individual attorney information set forth in Exhibits 1-3, the rates charged by the attorneys of Forrest, Mazow, McCullough, Yasi & Yasi, P.C., in litigating the Action, are fair and reasonable.

J. Plaintiff's Counsels' Fee Application is Unopposed and There Have been No Class Member Objections.

There have been no Class Member objections to date regarding the proposed fee allocation, which further supports approval of the application. The deadline for written objections to the Settlement Agreement and/or the proposed fee and expense allocation has passed. See, Exhibit 1 (*Affidavit of Michael C. Forrest*).

The lack of any objection to Plaintiff's Counsels' fee or any other term of the Settlement Agreement, coupled with effectuating the comprehensive Notice Plan, evidences implicit approval by the Class. This factor further weighs in favor of approval of this Application.

K. Plaintiff's Counsel is Entitled to Costs.

As part of this application, Plaintiff requests an award to reimburse for costs expended in pursuing this action, including the costs related to the administration of this claim. Here, Plaintiff's expenses include, but are not limited to: (a) the cost of filings; (b) the cost of service; (c) cost of mediation; (d) the costs of administration; and (e) other costs associated with litigation matters and

Davis, J.); and Gowen et al., v. Benchmark Assisted Living, LLC, CA No. 1684-CV-03972-BLS2 (June 1, 2021, Salinger, J.).

settlement. These expenses are itemized in Exhibit 4.

L. Plaintiff is Entitled to An Incentive Award for Serving as Class Representatives.

“Incentive awards are recognized as serving an important function in promoting class action settlements...” See e.g., In re Relafen Antitrust Litig., 231 F.R.D. 52, 82 (D. Mass. 2005); and Gordan v. Massachusetts Mut. Life Ins. Co., No. 13-CV-30184-MAP, 2016 WL 11272044, at *3 (D. Mass. Nov. 3, 2016)(“The court also awards each of the Named Plaintiffs \$20,000 for their vital contributions to this case. As an award for their time and efforts they have invested for the benefit of the class, courts may award special compensation to the class representatives. In this case, the Named Plaintiffs are deserving of these awards. By searching for, providing, requesting, and obtaining critical documents regarding the Plans, the Named Plaintiffs significantly aided Class Counsel’s investigation and ability to prepare a detailed complaint. For these reasons, the court finds that a case contribution award of \$20,000 for each Named Plaintiff is reasonable and fair.”).

As the Superior Court has observed, “[b]ecause a named plaintiff is an essential ingredient of any class action, an incentive award can be appropriate to encourage or induce an individual to participate in the suit.” Id. (internal citations omitted). Further, the state Courts have likewise found incentive awards proper for the named class representative. See e.g., Eldridge v. Provident Companies, Inc., 2005 WL 503701, at *3 (Mass. Super. Jan. 20, 2005, Sanders, J.)(allowing an award of \$12,500 for each of the two named class representatives).

Here, Plaintiff initiated the present claim by serving his own six-page M.G.L. c. 93A Demand. This demand was not responded to. Thereafter, Plaintiff engaged counsel in order to pursue litigation related to the collection of the challenged up-front fees.

Plaintiff worked closely with Plaintiff’s Counsel and spent hours reviewing

documents related to the litigation. Plaintiff also participated in the mediation process. Plaintiff's efforts continued after the Court denied initial certification.

Furthermore, Plaintiff closely participated in the settlement agreement drafting process and provided insight that further represented the interest of the class.

In the present Action, Plaintiff admirably assumed the role of class representative against a large and well-financed defendant. As such, Plaintiff seeks approval of an incentive award to the named plaintiff in this action. The amounts sought is fair and reasonable, as Plaintiff agreed to be the face of the litigation, and through that initiative played a significant part in obtaining this recovery for all ALR resident class members; including prospective equitable relief.

That is, Plaintiff invested a significant amount of time and participated in numerous interviews and meetings with counsel, faced the uncomfortable and emotional charge of representing a deceased loved one; participated in preparation for court hearings, answered formal written discovery; participated in the mediation and settlement of the claim, provided valuable assistance to counsel, including providing key documents and facts regarding the case, and finally, successfully vindicated and established the rights of the subject ALR residents.

It is not uncommon for courts to approve incentive payments in the range requested by this application. See, e.g., Godt et al. v. Anthony's Pier Four, Inc., Suffolk Civ. A. No. 07-3919 (Mass. Super. 2009) (\$25,000.00 incentive payment for plaintiff); Shea v. Weston Golf Club, Middlesex Civ. A. No. 02-1826 (Mass. Super. 2009) (\$25,000.00 incentive payments for lead plaintiffs); and Henderson v. BNY Mellon, Case No. 1:15-cv-10599-PBS (D. Mass.) (awarding named plaintiffs \$30,000.00 each); and Eldridge, *supra*.

Accordingly, in light of his service to the settlement class, Plaintiff respectfully requests the incentive award to Joel Burman, as personal representative of the estate of Mary Burman in

the amount of \$25,000.00.⁷

IV. CONCLUSION

For the foregoing reasons, and given the Plaintiff respectfully requests that the Court approve this Application for an award of attorneys' fees and expenses as follows:

- A. An award of attorneys' fees in the amount of \$250,000.00;
- B. An award of costs and expenses to Plaintiff's Counsel in the amount of \$96,670.00;
and
- C. Incentive Awards to the class representatives in the amount of \$25,000.00.

Respectfully submitted,
Plaintiff's Counsel,

/s/ Michael C. Forrest

DATED: May 1, 2023

Michael C. Forrest, Esq.
BBO #681401
Forrest, Mazow,
McCullough, Yasi & Yasi, P.C.
2 Salem green, Suite 2
Salem, MA 01970
(617) 231-7829

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that a true copy of the above document was served upon the attorney(s) of record for each other party by first class mail and email on this 1st day of May 2023:

/s/ Michael C. Forrest
Michael C. Forrest, Esq.

⁷ In an almost identical claim, four (4) separate class representatives were awarded incentive awards in similar amounts requested here. See, Gowen et al. v. Benchmark Senior Living Inc., CA No. 1684-cv-03972-BLS2, *Final Order and Judgement* (June 1, 2021, Salinger, J.)(Awarding incentive awards to four settlement class representatives in the amounts of: \$35,000; \$25,000; \$20,000; and \$20,000.

EXHIBIT 1

COMMONWEALTH OF MASSACHUSETTS

WORCESTER, ss.

SUPERIOR COURT
DEPARTMENT OF THE TRIAL COURT
CA No. 2085-CV-00971D

JOEL BURMAN as the Legal Representative of
the Estate of Mary Burman, on behalf of Ms.
Burman and all others similarly situated,

Plaintiff,

v.

CONTINUING CARE MANAGEMENT LLC;
WHITNEY PLACE AT SHARON LLC;
WHITNEY PLACE AT SHARON LIMITED
PARTNERSHIP, d/b/a WHITNEY PLACE AT
SHARON; WHITNEY PLACE AT SHARON
MANAGEMENT LLC; SALMON HEALTH
AND RETIREMENT; and SHI II WHITNEY
PLACE SHARON, LLC.,

Defendants.

**AFFIDAVIT OF MICHAEL C. FORREST, ESQ. IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF'S
APPLICATION FOR FEES AND COSTS**

I, Michael C. Forrest, being duly sworn, depose and say:

1. I have been an attorney of record for Plaintiff, Joel Burman, as the Legal Representative of the Estate of Mary Burman in this Action. I make this declaration on personal knowledge in support of Plaintiff's Assented-To Motion for Final Approval.
2. I submit this affidavit in further support of *Plaintiff's Unopposed Fee and Expense Application* which seeks an award of attorneys' fees to be paid with respect to litigation activities related to the litigation of this matter.
3. As of the filing of this application, Plaintiff has received no objections to the proposed settlement from settlement class members.

4. I now submit this affidavit providing a description of my legal experience and hourly rates attributable to this Action:
 - A. I am a *magna cum laude*, graduate of the University of Maine School of Law.
 - B. I have been a licensed attorney in Massachusetts, in good standing, since being admitted to the Massachusetts bar in November 2011.
 - C. I am an attorney in good standing with: The State Bar of California; the State Bar of New Hampshire (voluntarily inactive); The United States District Court for the District of Massachusetts; The United States District Court for the District of New Hampshire; The United States District Court for the Northern District of California; The United States Court of Appeals for the Ninth Circuit; and The United States Court of Appeals for the First Circuit.
 - D. In October 2015, I became the managing partner of Forrest, Mazow, McCullough, Yasi and Yasi, P.C., a position I continue to hold.
 - E. I am a member of the National Association of Consumer Advocates and the Consumer Attorneys of California.
 - F. My practice primarily involves litigation in the field of class and collective action litigation with regard to matters involving, *inter alia*, complex insurance litigation, consumer protection litigation, employment litigation, landlord/tenant litigation, and other complex litigation matters.
5. My current hourly rate, as managing partner, for legal services in complex civil litigation matters, including class actions, is \$525.00 per hour.
6. My current hourly rate has previously been approved by state and federal courts in the Commonwealth. See e.g., O'Hara et al. v. Diageo Beer Co. U.S.A., et al., CA No. 1:15-cv-

14139-MLW (Allowed December 2, 2021); Doe et al. v. Tewksbury Hospital, Ca No. 1881-cv-01495 (Allowed October 20, 2021); Hartigan et al. v. The Realty Assoc. fund X LP., et al., CA No. SUCV-2018-00056-BLS1 (Allowed October 5, 2021, Davis, J.); Gowen et al., v. Benchmark Assisted Living, LLC, CA No. 1684-CV-03972-BLS2 (June 1, 2021, Salinger, J.); Pierre et al. v. Stephens Automotive Transport Inc. d/b/a Stephens Automotive Transportation Services, CA. No. 1781-CV-03444 (Anti-Slapp Order on Application for Costs and Fees, Allowed, March 26, 2019, Howe, J.).

7. I assert that the rate is reasonable given my experience in complex class actions, as well as my experience in other litigation matters.
8. I assert that the rate is reasonable as it has been reviewed and approved by numerous Courts of the jurisdiction.
9. The total time I expended as of July 26, 2022, in efforts related to the litigation of this claim was 420 Hours.
10. My lodestar associated with this matter is \$220,500.00.
11. Despite my lodestar, Plaintiffs application seeks only 25% of the Claim Fund in the amount of \$250,000.00 as fees for the successful prosecution of this action.

Signed under the pains and penalties of perjury this 1st day of May 2023.

/s/ Michael C. Forrest

Michael C. Forrest, Esq.

EXHIBIT 2

COMMONWEALTH OF MASSACHUSETTS

ESSEX, ss.

SUPERIOR COURT DEPARTMENT
CA No. 2077-CV-00431A

MATTHEW MORAN, on behalf of himself
and all others similarly situated,

Plaintiff,

v.

STONEHILL COLLEGE, INC.,

Defendant.

AFFIDAVIT OF JOHN R. YASI, ESQ.
IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF'S FEE AND EXPENSE APPLICATION

I, John R. Yasi, being duly sworn, depose and say:

1. I am a founding partner in the law firm of Forrest, Mazow, McCullough, Yasi & Yasi, P.C.
2. I have been an attorney of record for Plaintiff, Joel Burman, as the Legal Representative of the Estate of Mary Burman, and the settlement class ("Plaintiff") in this matter from the outset of this Action.
3. I make this declaration on personal knowledge in support of *Plaintiff's Unopposed Fee and Expense Application*, filed per the terms as set forth in the Settlement Agreement.
4. The following contains a description of my legal experience and my hourly rates attributable to this action:
 - a) I have been a practicing attorney in Massachusetts, in good standing, since being admitted to the bar in December of 1990;
 - b) Over approximately the last twelve (13) years I have successfully represented individuals and classes in numerous complex litigation and class-action claims.

5. My current hourly rate for legal services in complex civil litigation matters, including class actions, is: \$625.00/hour.
6. My current hourly rate of \$625.00 per hour has previously been approved by courts in the Commonwealth. See e.g., Doe et al. v. Tewksbury Hospital, Ca No. 1881-cv-01495 (Allowed October 20, 2021); Hartigan et al. v. The Realty Assoc. fund X LP., et al., CA No. SUCV-2018-00056-BLS1 (Allowed October 5, 2021, Davis, J.); Gowen et al., v. Benchmark Assisted Living, LLC, CA No. 1684-CV-03972-BLS2 (June 1, 2021, Salinger, J.); Polankik et al. v. Boston Hill Donuts, LLC, et al., CA No. 1784CV00914-BLS2 (Allowed, September 28, 2017, Leibensperger, J.); Hyman et al. v. Metropolitan Property & Casualty Ins. Co., et al., CA No. SUCV-1684-CV-00488-BLS2 (Allowed, August 23, 2017, Sanders, J.); Kappotis et al. v. Bertucci's, Inc. et al., CA No. SUCV-1584-CV-03821-BLS1 (Allowed, February 24, 2017, Kaplan, J.); Spadea et al. v. Medical Records Associates, LLC, CA. No. SUCV-1684-CV-02007 (Allowed, June 21, 2017, Connolly, J.); and Blazak, et al., v. Well Life Medical, P.C., CA No. 1577-CV-02000D (Allowed, November 9, 2017, Tabit, J).
7. This rate is reasonable given my years of experience in representing numerous individuals in civil matters, handling cases involving Massachusetts consumer protection law, and representing classes in numerous successful class actions.
8. I expended 257.00 hours for efforts related to the Action against Defendant, for a total fee of \$161,062.50 at my current rate of \$625.00/ hour.

Signed under the pains and penalties of perjury this 1st day of May 2023.

/s/ John R. Yasi

John R. Yasi, Esq.

EXHIBIT 3

COMMONWEALTH OF MASSACHUSETTS

ESSEX, ss.

SUPERIOR COURT DEPARTMENT
CA No. 2077-CV-00431A

MATTHEW MORAN, on behalf of
himself and all others similarly
situated,

Plaintiff,

v.

STONEHILL COLLEGE, INC.,

Defendant.

AFFIDAVIT OF ROBERT E. MAZOW, ESQ.
IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF'S FEE AND EXPENSE APPLICATION

I, Robert E. Mazow, hereby depose and state the following:

1. I have been an attorney of record from the outset of this Action.
2. I make this declaration on personal knowledge in support of *Plaintiff's Unopposed Fee and Expense Application*, filed per the terms of the Settlement Agreement entered into by the Parties to this Action.
3. I am submitting this Affidavit in further support of my firm's application for an award of Attorneys' fees to be paid out of the common fund.
4. This Affidavit provides a description of my legal experience and my hourly rates attributable to this Action.
5. My compensation arrangement for the services rendered to the Class has been wholly contingent. Neither the plaintiff nor any other person has paid me any retainer or other fee in connection with this matter. Moreover, any fee and reimbursement of expenses which I receive will be limited to the amount approved by the Court.

6. Throughout the course of this litigation, I maintained contemporaneous time records. I spent a total of 16.20 hours on this matter. All of my time was reasonable and necessary for the effective representation of Plaintiff and the Class Members.
7. My rate is reasonable given my experience in complex class actions. Fees that I have sought at a rate of \$625.00/hour have been approved by the Massachusetts Courts in the following matters: Doe et al. v. Tewksbury Hospital, Ca No. 1881-cv-01495 (Allowed October 20, 2021); Hartigan et al. v. The Realty Assoc. fund X LP., et al., CA No. SUCV-2018-00056-BLS1 (Allowed October 5, 2021, Davis, J.); and Gowen et al., v. Benchmark Assisted Living, LLC, CA No. 1684-CV-03972-BLS2 (June 1, 2021, Salinger, J.).
8. The following is a summary of relevant professional information:
 - a) I am a 1994 graduate of the New England School of Law;
 - b) I was admitted to the bar of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts in 1994. I have also been admitted to the bar of the State of New Hampshire, and the bars of the United States District Court for the districts of Massachusetts and New Hampshire.
 - c) I am a member in good standing of all bars to which I have been admitted and I am not aware of any disciplinary proceedings against me.
 - d) From 1995 to approximately 1998, I was an Assistant District Attorney in Essex County, Massachusetts. From 1998 to 2000 I was an attorney at the law firm of Peabody & Arnold, LLP in Boston, Massachusetts where my practice was primarily in the area of insurance defense. From 2000 to 2002 I was with the Law Offices of Robert E. Mazow in Chelsea, Massachusetts where my practice consisted of criminal defense and general civil litigation.

- e) From 2002 to the present, I have been with the law firm of Mazow | McCullough, PC in Salem, Massachusetts. My practice consists of general civil litigation in federal and state court and I represent almost exclusively plaintiffs in personal injury matters. My practice also includes representing consumers in the area of consumer protection violation matters.
- f) Over the past 13 years, I have also represented individuals as putative class representatives and as class representatives in several class-action claims.
- g) My participation in this action over the approximate last three (3) years has involved oversight, and the drafting and editing of pleadings, motions, memoranda, and discovery requests/materials.
- h) I am a founding partner of Forrest, Mazow, McCullough, Yasi & Yasi, P.C., the firm that represents Plaintiff and the settlement Class in this action.

Signed under the penalties of perjury this 1st day of May 2023

/s/ Robert E. Mazow

Robert E. Mazow

EXHIBIT 4



FORREST, MAZOW,
MCCULLOUGH, YASI & YASI, P.C.
CONSUMER ADVOCACY AND CLASS ACTION LITIGATION



MASTER BILL
(Through April 12, 2023)

RE: BURMAN, et al v. CONTINUING CARE MANAGEMENT LLC, et al
Civil Action No. 2085-CV-00971D

ATTORNEYS' FEES

Name	Hours	Rate	Amount
Michael C. Forrest, Esq.	420	525.00	\$220,500.00
Robert E. Mazow, Esq.	16.20	625.00	\$10,125.00
John R. Yasi, Esq.	257.70	625.00	\$161,062.50
Billable Fees Total:	693.90		\$391,687.50

LITIGATION EXPENSES

DATE	DESCRIPTION	AMOUNT
08/31/20	Complaint Filing and Summons Fee	\$305.00
10/8/20	Suffolk County Sheriff's Department – Service on SHI II Whitney Place Sharon, LLC	\$57.10
10/13/20	Worcester County Sheriff's Department – Service on Salmon Health and Retirement	\$48.90
10/13/20	Worcester County Sheriff's Department – Service on Continuing Care Management LLC	\$38.00
10/13/20	Worcester County Sheriff's Department – Service on Whitney Place at Sharon LLC	\$68.90
10/13/20	Worcester County Sheriff's Department – Service on Whitney Place at Sharon LLC	\$38.00
10/19/20	Norfolk County Sheriff's Department – Service on Whitney Place at Sharon Limited Partnership	\$59.98
8/16/21	Modevity LLC – Research Services- Salmon Health	\$2,300.00
9/25/21	UPS Next Day Air Package to Judge Hinkle	\$33.04
12/3/21	JAMS – Mediation Deposit	\$3,750.00
5/31/22	Hotel Cancellation Fee – 6/2 Hearing Canceled	\$216.64

7/19/22	Hotel for 8/4 Cert Hearing – MCF	\$509.52
7/19/22	JetBlue - Airfare – 8/4 Cert Hearing - MCF	\$1,178.61
7/19/22	Transportation – 8/4 Cert Hearing – MCF	\$366.04
7/26/22	Printing – Prep for 8/4 Cert Hearing – MCF	\$57.00
8/16/22	Shea Court Reporting – 8/4 Cert Hearing Transcript – MCF	\$144.00
4/25/23	BrownGreer Finance – Settlement Administration Fee	\$87,500.00
Total Expense Costs:		\$96,670.73

TOTAL BILLABLE ATTORNEYS’ FEES AND COSTS: \$488,358.23

EXHIBIT 5

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

Date	User	Activity	Rate	Duration	Total	Description
8/11/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00	
8/11/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00	
8/11/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00	
8/11/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50	
8/12/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00	
8/13/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00	
8/14/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00	
8/17/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50	
8/17/2020	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	1.2	\$630.00	
8/18/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50	
8/18/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50	
8/18/2020	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	1.9	\$997.50	
8/19/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00	
8/21/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50	
8/22/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00	
8/24/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00	
8/24/2020	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00	
8/24/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50	
8/24/2020	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	1	\$525.00	
8/24/2020	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50	
8/25/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50	
8/25/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50	
8/25/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00	
8/25/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00	
8/26/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00	
8/26/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50	
8/26/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50	
8/27/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00	

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

8/27/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/27/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Correspondence	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/28/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Correspondence	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/28/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/28/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/29/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/31/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/2/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Correspondence	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/8/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/9/2020	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/9/2020	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/14/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/15/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/15/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/16/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/16/2020	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/16/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/16/2020	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/16/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Correspondence	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/16/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/17/2020	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/17/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/17/2020	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/17/2020	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/17/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/17/2020	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/25/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

9/25/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/28/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Correspondence	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/28/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/28/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/29/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/29/2020	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
9/29/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/29/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/29/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/29/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/29/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/30/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/30/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/30/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/30/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/30/2020	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/30/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/30/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/30/2020	Michael C Forrest	Draft Discovery Requests	\$525.00	1.8	\$945.00
9/30/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/1/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/1/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/1/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/2/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/2/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/9/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

10/12/2020	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/12/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
10/12/2020	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
10/12/2020	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/13/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/13/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
10/13/2020	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/13/2020	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/13/2020	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/13/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/14/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/19/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/19/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/19/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/20/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/20/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/20/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/20/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/21/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/21/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/21/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/21/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/21/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/21/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/21/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/22/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Correspondence	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/22/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/23/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/27/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/2/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/3/2020	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

11/4/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/4/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/5/2020	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Depo Notice/Subpoena	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/5/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/5/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/6/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/9/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
11/10/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
11/11/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/12/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/16/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/16/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/16/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/16/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/17/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/17/2020	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/18/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
12/8/2020	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/8/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/14/2020	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/14/2020	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
1/8/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Client Doc.	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
1/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/28/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
1/28/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/28/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

1/28/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
1/28/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
1/28/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
1/28/2021	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
1/28/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
1/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Client Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
2/3/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/8/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/8/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/10/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/10/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/18/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
2/19/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/19/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
2/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Order/Notice	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
3/3/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

3/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
3/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/5/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/5/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	1.2	\$630.00
3/9/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/9/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/9/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
3/9/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
3/31/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/31/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/12/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
4/12/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/12/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
4/19/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
4/30/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/3/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
5/11/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/12/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/12/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

5/12/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
5/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
5/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
5/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
5/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Client Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
5/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/17/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/26/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/26/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/26/2021	Michael C Forrest	Deposition	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
5/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
6/7/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
6/7/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Memorandum/Commu- nication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
6/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

6/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
6/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
6/17/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/17/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/17/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/17/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Discovery Responses	\$525.00	1.6	\$840.00
6/17/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Discovery Responses	\$525.00	1.6	\$840.00
6/18/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/18/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
6/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
6/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
6/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
6/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
6/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Client Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
6/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
6/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/25/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

6/25/2021	Michael C Forrest	Client Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Client Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
6/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Client meeting	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
6/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Discovery Responses	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
6/30/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/6/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/6/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/8/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
7/8/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/8/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/8/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/12/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
7/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
7/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
7/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
7/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
7/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
7/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
7/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

7/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
7/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
7/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
7/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
7/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
7/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/19/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/19/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Discovery Responses	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
7/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
7/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
7/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
7/26/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/26/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
7/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

7/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Discovery Responses	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
7/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
7/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/30/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/30/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
7/30/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
7/30/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	1.2	\$630.00
8/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
8/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
8/3/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/11/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/11/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/11/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review - Report	\$525.00	1.7	\$892.50
8/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

8/18/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/18/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/18/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/18/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/19/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/19/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	2.3	\$1,207.50
8/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
8/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
8/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
8/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/25/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/25/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/25/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/25/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/26/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/26/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
8/31/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

9/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.8	\$945.00
9/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
9/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Client Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	2.2	\$1,155.00
9/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	1.2	\$630.00
9/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.7	\$892.50
9/7/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
9/7/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
9/8/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
9/8/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
9/8/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/9/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/9/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
9/9/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/10/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/10/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/10/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/10/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/10/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

9/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
9/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
9/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
9/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
9/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
9/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/17/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/17/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

9/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
9/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.4	\$735.00
9/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
9/20/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
9/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

9/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Mediation	\$525.00	5.3	\$2,782.50
9/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
9/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.4	\$735.00
9/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
9/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
9/28/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
9/30/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/30/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review - Report	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/30/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/30/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

9/30/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
10/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
10/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
10/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/4/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
10/5/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/6/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
10/6/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Depo Notice	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/8/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
10/8/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.4	\$735.00
10/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
10/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	2.2	\$1,155.00
10/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/18/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	1.7	\$892.50
10/18/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.4	\$735.00
10/18/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/19/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
10/21/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

10/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
10/24/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/26/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.7	\$892.50
10/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/27/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/28/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
10/28/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
10/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	1.7	\$892.50
10/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
10/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
11/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.6	\$840.00
11/1/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/2/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/3/2021	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
11/3/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Depo Notice	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
11/3/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	1.9	\$997.50
11/3/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/9/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/10/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/10/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/10/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/19/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/19/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/19/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/22/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
11/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
11/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	2.1	\$1,102.50
11/23/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
12/3/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/6/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/6/2021	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
12/7/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
12/7/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/7/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

12/9/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/9/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
12/9/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/10/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
12/10/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
12/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	2.1	\$1,102.50
12/13/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
12/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
12/14/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
12/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
12/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/15/2021	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
12/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
12/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
12/16/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/28/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
12/29/2021	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/5/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
1/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
1/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

1/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
1/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
1/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/24/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	1.6	\$840.00
1/24/2022	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
1/24/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
1/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
1/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/14/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/14/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
2/14/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Order/Notice	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/28/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/28/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Discovery Responses/Requests	\$525.00	1.8	\$945.00
2/28/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.2	\$630.00
2/28/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
3/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
3/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.6	\$840.00
3/4/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
3/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

3/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
4/4/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
4/5/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
4/5/2022	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
4/5/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
4/5/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	1.6	\$840.00
4/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
4/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
4/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
4/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/13/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/13/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
4/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/2/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/4/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
5/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
5/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

5/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
5/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/24/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/24/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
5/24/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/24/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/24/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
5/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/26/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/31/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
5/31/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
5/31/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
5/31/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/31/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
5/31/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
5/31/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
5/31/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
6/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
6/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

6/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
6/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
6/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
6/28/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
6/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Order/Notice	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
7/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Preparation for Appearance	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
7/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
7/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
7/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/26/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
7/26/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
7/28/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

8/2/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	1.2	\$630.00
8/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
8/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
8/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Travel Time	\$525.00	9.4	\$4,935.00
8/4/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/4/2022	Michael C Forrest	Travel Time	\$262.00	2.2	\$576.40
8/4/2022	Michael C Forrest	Appearance	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
8/4/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
8/5/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/5/2022	Michael C Forrest	Travel Time	\$262.00	7.1	\$1,860.20
8/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
8/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

8/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Order/Notice	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
8/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
8/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
8/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	1.6	\$840.00
8/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.8	\$945.00
8/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
8/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
8/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Transcript	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
8/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
8/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
8/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.6	\$840.00
8/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
8/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
8/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.2	\$630.00
8/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

8/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
8/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
8/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Notes to File	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/24/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/24/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
8/24/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/26/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/26/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
8/26/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
8/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
8/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
8/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
8/31/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
8/31/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
8/31/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

8/31/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/2/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/2/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/2/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/2/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/2/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
9/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
9/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
9/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
9/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
9/13/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/14/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.2	\$630.00
9/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.7	\$892.50
9/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

9/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
9/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/23/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
9/26/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/26/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
9/27/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.5	\$787.50
9/27/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/27/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/27/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
9/27/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
9/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
9/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
9/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
10/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
10/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
10/4/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/5/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/11/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
10/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

10/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/14/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
10/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/18/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review - Report	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
10/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review order	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
10/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
10/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
10/24/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
10/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

10/25/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
11/3/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	1.7	\$892.50
11/8/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/9/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/10/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/14/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/16/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
11/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
11/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/17/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Settlement Documentation	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
11/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

11/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
11/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/28/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/28/2022	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/28/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/28/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
11/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
11/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
11/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/29/2022	Michael C Forrest	E-file	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
11/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
11/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
11/30/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review - Settlement Agreement	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
12/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
12/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/1/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/2/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
12/2/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/2/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

12/5/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
12/5/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
12/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/6/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/7/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Order/Notice	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/12/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/13/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/14/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/14/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/15/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
12/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/19/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
12/20/2022	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/21/2022	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
12/22/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
12/27/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/27/2022	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
12/27/2022	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

1/3/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/4/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/4/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/4/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
1/4/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/4/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/4/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/5/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/6/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.8	\$420.00
1/6/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/6/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/8/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
1/8/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review - Settlement Agreement	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
1/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/10/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/10/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/11/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/11/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/11/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/12/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/12/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
1/12/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/12/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/12/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

1/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/17/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
1/18/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/18/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
1/18/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
1/18/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review - Settement Agreement	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
1/18/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.6	\$840.00
1/18/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	2.1	\$1,102.50
1/18/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Pleading	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
1/18/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/19/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review - Settement Agreement	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
1/19/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/19/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/19/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Settlement Documentation	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
1/19/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
1/19/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.4	\$735.00
1/19/2023	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
1/20/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
1/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/30/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
1/30/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
1/31/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/2/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/2/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review order	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/3/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/3/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/3/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

2/3/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/7/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/7/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/7/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/7/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/7/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/7/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/7/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/8/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/8/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
2/8/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
2/8/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.2	\$630.00
2/8/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
2/8/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/8/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/8/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/10/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Legal Research	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/14/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/14/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/14/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/14/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/15/2023	Michael C Forrest	Client Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

2/15/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/15/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/15/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/15/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/15/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/15/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/15/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/16/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/16/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/16/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/16/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/16/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/16/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
2/19/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/20/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/20/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/21/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/21/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/22/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/22/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/22/2023	Michael C Forrest	Meeting	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/22/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Pleading	\$525.00	0.7	\$367.50
2/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
2/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

2/24/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Order/Notice	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/24/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Correspondence	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
2/27/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/27/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/27/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
2/27/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
2/27/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
3/1/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
3/1/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/1/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
3/1/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/1/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/2/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Order/Notice	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/6/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/6/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/6/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/7/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/7/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/7/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/8/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/8/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/9/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/10/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
3/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
3/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

3/13/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/14/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/14/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/15/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/17/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
3/20/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/20/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/21/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Order/Notice	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/21/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
3/21/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
3/21/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/21/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/22/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/22/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Order/Notice	\$525.00	0.6	\$315.00
3/22/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
3/23/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review - Report	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
3/27/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
3/31/2023	Michael C Forrest	Review/Analysis of Order/Notice	\$525.00	0.4	\$210.00
3/31/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/3/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/3/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/3/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/3/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.6	\$840.00
4/3/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.6	\$840.00
4/3/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/4/2023	Michael C Forrest	Email Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/4/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.8	\$945.00
4/4/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/4/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

4/4/2023	Michael C Forrest	Client Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/4/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
4/5/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.5	\$262.50
4/5/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
4/6/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/6/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	1.1	\$577.50
4/6/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	1.3	\$682.50
4/7/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/7/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	0.9	\$472.50
4/10/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.3	\$157.50
4/10/2023	Michael C Forrest	Communication	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/10/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.1	\$52.50
4/11/2023	Michael C Forrest	Call	\$525.00	0.2	\$105.00
4/11/2023	Michael C Forrest	Draft Memorandum	\$525.00	2.2	\$1,155.00

9/15/2020	Robert Mazow	Call	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/11/2020	Robert Mazow	Call	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
10/11/2020	Robert Mazow	Review/Analysis - Memorandum/Commu- nication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/12/2020	Robert Mazow	Meeting	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/20/2020	Robert Mazow	Call	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
1/27/2021	Robert Mazow	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
5/11/2021	Robert Mazow	Meeting/Conference	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/2/2021	Robert Mazow	Email Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/12/2021	Robert Mazow	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/14/2021	Robert Mazow	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/14/2021	Robert Mazow	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/16/2021	Robert Mazow	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/23/2021	Robert Mazow	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/21/2021	Robert Mazow	Draft Memorandum	\$625.00	1.1	\$687.50
10/27/2021	Robert Mazow	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

11/2/2021	Robert Mazow	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/2/2021	Robert Mazow	Draft Memorandum	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
11/2/2021	Robert Mazow	Draft Memorandum	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
11/3/2021	Robert Mazow	Draft Memorandum	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
11/3/2021	Robert Mazow	Draft Memorandum	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
11/3/2021	Robert Mazow	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
1/12/2022	Robert Mazow	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
2/22/2022	Robert Mazow	Review/Analysis - Litigation File	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
2/22/2023	Robert Mazow	Preparation	\$625.00	2.5	\$1,562.50
2/23/2023	Robert Mazow	Appearance	\$625.00	3.5	\$2,187.50

8/11/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/14/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/18/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/19/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/19/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/20/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
8/20/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/20/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/20/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
8/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.3	\$812.50
8/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.4	\$875.00
8/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
8/22/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/22/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/22/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/24/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/24/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/24/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.7	\$1,062.50
8/24/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

8/24/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/25/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/27/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
8/27/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
8/29/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/8/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.1	\$687.50
9/8/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
9/9/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
9/9/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/12/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/15/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
9/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
9/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/17/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/17/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/17/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/28/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
9/28/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/29/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
9/29/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/29/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/29/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
9/29/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/29/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/30/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/30/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/30/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
9/30/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/30/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/1/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

10/2/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/2/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/3/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/9/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
10/10/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/10/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
10/10/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.1	\$687.50
10/11/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	2.3	\$1,437.50
10/11/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.7	\$1,062.50
10/11/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
10/12/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/12/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
10/12/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/13/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
10/13/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/13/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/13/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/13/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/13/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/14/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/14/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
10/15/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/19/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/19/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
10/19/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/19/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/19/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/20/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/20/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.6	\$1,000.00
10/20/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

10/20/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
10/20/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/20/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
10/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/22/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
10/22/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
10/22/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/23/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/23/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/23/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
10/23/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/30/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/31/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
11/1/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/2/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/4/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/5/2020	John Yasi	Correspondence	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/5/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/5/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/5/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/6/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
11/9/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
11/9/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/9/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/10/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

11/10/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/10/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/10/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/10/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/10/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/11/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/14/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
11/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/17/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/17/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
11/18/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/24/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
12/11/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
12/13/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
12/14/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
12/14/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
12/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
12/16/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
12/18/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
12/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
12/21/2020	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
1/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
1/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
1/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
1/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
1/5/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
1/27/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
1/27/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
1/27/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
1/28/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

1/28/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00
1/28/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
1/28/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
1/28/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
1/28/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
1/28/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
1/30/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.1	\$687.50
2/1/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
2/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
2/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
2/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
2/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
2/8/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
2/8/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/10/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/10/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
2/10/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/11/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/11/2021	John Yasi	Client meeting	\$625.00	1.3	\$812.50
2/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
2/16/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
2/17/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/17/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/19/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
2/19/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
2/19/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/22/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

3/1/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
3/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
3/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
3/3/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
3/5/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
3/5/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
3/6/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
3/7/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
3/9/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
3/9/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
3/9/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
3/9/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
3/9/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
3/9/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
3/9/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
3/31/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
3/31/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
4/12/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
4/12/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
4/12/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
4/19/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
4/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
4/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
4/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
5/12/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
5/12/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
5/12/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00
5/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.7	\$1,062.50
5/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
5/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
5/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
5/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
5/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

5/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
5/14/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
5/17/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
5/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
5/25/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
5/25/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
6/7/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
6/14/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
6/14/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
6/16/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
6/16/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
6/16/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
6/16/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
6/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
6/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
6/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
6/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
6/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
6/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
6/25/2021	John Yasi	Correspondence	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
6/29/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
6/30/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
7/1/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
7/5/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
7/6/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/6/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
7/7/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
7/7/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/8/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
7/8/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/10/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/12/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

7/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
7/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
7/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
7/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/14/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
7/14/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
7/15/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
7/15/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
7/15/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
7/19/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
7/19/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
7/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
7/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
7/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
7/22/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
7/22/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
7/26/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.1	\$687.50
7/26/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/27/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
7/27/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/27/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
7/27/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/29/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
7/29/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
7/29/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
7/29/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/30/2021	John Yasi	Call	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
8/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

8/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00
8/6/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/11/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/11/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/11/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/12/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/16/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
8/18/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/18/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/18/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/18/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/19/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
8/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
8/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00
8/22/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
8/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
8/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
8/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/25/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/1/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

9/3/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/5/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	3	\$1,875.00
9/5/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/7/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/7/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.1	\$687.50
9/9/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	2.1	\$1,312.50
9/9/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/10/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.4	\$875.00
9/12/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
9/12/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
9/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/13/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/14/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
9/14/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
9/14/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/14/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
9/14/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/15/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
9/15/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
9/15/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/15/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
9/16/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/16/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/16/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/17/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
9/17/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
9/17/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/17/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
9/17/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
9/17/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
9/18/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.7	\$1,062.50
9/18/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

9/18/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.3	\$812.50
9/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
9/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
9/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
9/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00
9/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
9/20/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
9/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.6	\$1,000.00
9/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.9	\$1,187.50
9/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/21/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
9/22/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	2.9	\$1,812.50
9/22/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	5.9	\$3,687.50
9/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00
9/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.1	\$687.50
9/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
9/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
9/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/24/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/27/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/27/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
9/28/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/29/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/29/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00
9/30/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/30/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
10/1/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00
10/1/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

10/1/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/1/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/3/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
10/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/5/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
10/6/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
10/10/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.3	\$812.50
10/10/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/16/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
10/16/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	2.5	\$1,562.50
10/22/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	2.1	\$1,312.50
10/22/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
10/22/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/22/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
10/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
10/26/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/26/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
10/27/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/27/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/29/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
10/29/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
10/29/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
10/31/2021	John Yasi	Call	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
11/1/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
11/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.9	\$1,187.50
11/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
11/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
11/2/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
11/3/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

11/3/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.4	\$875.00
11/3/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/3/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
11/3/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
11/3/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
11/3/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.1	\$687.50
11/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00
11/4/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/5/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
11/9/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/10/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
11/10/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/22/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
11/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
11/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
11/23/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
12/7/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
12/7/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
12/9/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
12/10/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
12/12/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
12/15/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
12/29/2021	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
1/14/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
1/14/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
1/19/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
1/19/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
1/19/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.3	\$812.50
1/24/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
1/24/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
1/25/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
2/12/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

2/19/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
3/1/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
3/9/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
3/10/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
3/11/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
3/11/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
4/2/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.3	\$812.50
4/9/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.4	\$875.00
4/10/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
4/22/2022	John Yasi	Review/Analysis of Order/Notice	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
4/29/2022	John Yasi	Email Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
5/2/2022	John Yasi	Call	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
5/19/2022	John Yasi	Call	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
5/20/2022	John Yasi	Email Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
5/20/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
5/20/2022	John Yasi	Email Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
5/23/2022	John Yasi	Email Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
5/23/2022	John Yasi	Call	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
5/23/2022	John Yasi	Call	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
5/23/2022	John Yasi	Email Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
5/24/2022	John Yasi	Call	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
5/24/2022	John Yasi	Draft Correspondence	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
5/25/2022	John Yasi	Call	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
5/25/2022	John Yasi	Call	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
5/25/2022	John Yasi	Email Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
5/31/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
6/1/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
6/1/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
6/3/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
6/6/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
6/6/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
6/20/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

6/20/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
6/20/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
6/21/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
6/23/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
6/28/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
6/28/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
6/30/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
7/19/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
7/25/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
7/25/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	6	\$3,750.00
7/26/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
7/30/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
8/3/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
8/3/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
8/3/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
8/3/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/3/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
8/4/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/4/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
8/4/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/4/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
8/4/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00
8/5/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
8/5/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.1	\$687.50
8/5/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/5/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/5/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
8/6/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
8/6/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
8/6/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
8/8/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
8/8/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
8/8/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

8/8/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.3	\$812.50
8/9/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
8/9/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/9/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/10/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1	\$625.00
8/10/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
8/11/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00
8/11/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
8/11/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/11/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/13/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.3	\$812.50
8/14/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
8/14/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
8/14/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/15/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.8	\$500.00
8/15/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
8/15/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/16/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
8/16/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
8/16/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/17/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
8/17/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
8/18/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/19/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
8/23/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/25/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/25/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
8/26/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
8/26/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50
8/28/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
8/29/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
8/30/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
8/30/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.7	\$437.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

8/30/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/2/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/3/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
9/6/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/6/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
9/7/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
9/7/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/7/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/7/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/7/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/7/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/7/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
9/8/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/9/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/9/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
9/10/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/16/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.2	\$750.00
9/16/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
9/18/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/19/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
9/27/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
9/27/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/10/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/10/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/11/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/11/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.1	\$62.50
10/11/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/17/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/17/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
10/24/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	1.9	\$1,187.50
11/8/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/16/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
11/17/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50

Burman et al. v. Salmon Health et al.

Time Through 4/14/23

11/17/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
11/21/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
11/29/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00
12/7/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
12/22/2022	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.6	\$375.00
2/17/2023	John Yasi	Review/Analysis - Correspondence	\$625.00	0.2	\$125.00
2/17/2023	John Yasi	Communication	\$625.00	0.3	\$187.50
2/17/2023	John Yasi	Draft Correspondence	\$625.00	0.5	\$312.50
2/17/2023	John Yasi	Call	\$625.00	0.4	\$250.00